
Project: Administration Addition & Remodel
Location: 9788 West 151st Street, Orland Park, IL

Owner: Orland Fire Protection District
Architect: SRBL Architects, Ltd.

Bid Package #:  Budget Value: -$                     
Description: Pre-Award Date:

Attendees:
Bid Due Date:
Bid Due Time:
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SCOPE DESCRIPTION
Base Bid 198,640$           163,000$             206,100$             197,040$             235,750$             
Alt #1-Replace Concrete Apron 6,822$               3,500$                 4,800$                 6,245$                 16,250$               
Alt #2-PT-1 & PT-2 In Lieu of RT-
1 & RT-2
Alt #3-New CU-2 & CU-3 In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #4-E1: New Generator In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #5-110% P&P Bond No Bid No Bid 56,720$               6,895$                 3,500$                 

Subtotal: 205,462$           166,500$             267,620$             210,180$             255,500$             -$                         -$                         -$                         

OFPD/RCCI Appv'd (Y/N)
Prequalification Form (Y/N) Y Submitted N Y Y
Ins. Exp. Modifier (#)
Ackn. Schedule (Y/N)
Addenda (#, Y/N) 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y
Labor Rates (Y/N) Y Y Y N Y
Unit Prices (Y/N) Y Y Y N Y
Bid Bond (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y
P&P Bond (Y/N)
Delivery (Y/N)
Sales Tax (Y/N)
Union (Y/N)
Pre-Bid Meeting (Y/N)
Site Walk-Thru (Y/N)
Post-Bid Interview (Y/N)
Notes/Comments

Total: 205,462$           166,500$             267,620$             210,180$             255,500$             -$                         -$                         -$                         

Recommended Award:

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Daniel Smith, Battalion Chief DATE Salvatore (Bob) Cacciato, Trustee, Secretary DATE

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Bryant Krizik, Fire Chief DATE Patrick Maher, Trustee, President DATE

Contract 1.02
Site Preparation & Earthwork

July 7, 2010
2:00 PM

CONTRACTOR
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Project: Administration Addition & Remodel
Location: 9788 West 151st Street, Orland Park, IL

Owner: Orland Fire Protection District
Architect: SRBL Architects, Ltd.

Bid Package #:  Budget Value: -$                     
Description: Pre-Award Date:

Attendees:
Bid Due Date:
Bid Due Time:
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SCOPE DESCRIPTION
Base Bid 77,568$             89,200$               119,800$             110,290$             126,808$             99,995$               
Alt #1-Replace Concrete Apron No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3,500$                 
Alt #2-PT-1 & PT-2 In Lieu of RT-
1 & RT-2
Alt #3-New CU-2 & CU-3 In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #4-E1: New Generator In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #5-110% P&P Bond No Bid 3,475$                 No Bid 1,213$                 1,229$                 1,700$                 

Subtotal: 77,568$             92,675$               119,800$             111,503$             128,037$             105,195$             -$                         -$                         

OFPD/RCCI Appv'd (Y/N)
Prequalification Form (Y/N) Y N Submitted Y Submitted Y
Ins. Exp. Modifier (#)
Ackn. Schedule (Y/N)
Addenda (#, Y/N) 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y
Labor Rates (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y Y
Unit Prices (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y Y
Bid Bond (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y Y
P&P Bond (Y/N)
Delivery (Y/N)
Sales Tax (Y/N)
Union (Y/N)
Pre-Bid Meeting (Y/N)
Site Walk-Thru (Y/N)
Post-Bid Interview (Y/N)
Notes/Comments

Total: 77,568$             92,675$               119,800$             111,503$             128,037$             105,195$             -$                         -$                         

Recommended Award:

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Daniel Smith, Battalion Chief DATE Salvatore (Bob) Cacciato, Trustee, Secretary DATE

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Bryant Krizik, Fire Chief DATE Patrick Maher, Trustee, President DATE

Contract 1.03
Site Utilities

July 7, 2010
2:00 PM

CONTRACTOR
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Project: Administration Addition & Remodel
Location: 9788 West 151st Street, Orland Park, IL

Owner: Orland Fire Protection District
Architect: SRBL Architects, Ltd.

Bid Package #:  Budget Value: -$                     
Description: Pre-Award Date:

Attendees:
Bid Due Date:
Bid Due Time:
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SCOPE DESCRIPTION
Base Bid 124,712$           69,900$               63,950$               65,000$               102,240$             117,945$             
Alt #1-Replace Concrete Apron
Alt #2-PT-1 & PT-2 In Lieu of RT-
1 & RT-2
Alt #3-New CU-2 & CU-3 In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #4-E1: New Generator In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #5-110% P&P Bond 1,515$               2,000$                 2,110$                 825$                    1,635$                 1,600$                 

Subtotal: 126,227$           71,900$               66,060$               65,825$               103,875$             119,545$             -$                         -$                         

OFPD/RCCI Appv'd (Y/N)
Prequalification Form (Y/N) Y Y Responded Y Submitted Submitted
Ins. Exp. Modifier (#)
Ackn. Schedule (Y/N)
Addenda (#, Y/N) 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y
Labor Rates (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y Y
Unit Prices (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y Y
Bid Bond (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y Y
P&P Bond (Y/N)
Delivery (Y/N)
Sales Tax (Y/N)
Union (Y/N)
Pre-Bid Meeting (Y/N)
Site Walk-Thru (Y/N)
Post-Bid Interview (Y/N)
Notes/Comments

Total: 126,227$           71,900$               66,060$               65,825$               103,875$             119,545$             -$                         -$                         

Recommended Award:

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Daniel Smith, Battalion Chief DATE Salvatore (Bob) Cacciato, Trustee, Secretary DATE

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Bryant Krizik, Fire Chief DATE Patrick Maher, Trustee, President DATE

Contract 1.04
Permeable Interlocking Pavers

July 7, 2010
2:00 PM

CONTRACTOR
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Project: Administration Addition & Remodel
Location: 9788 West 151st Street, Orland Park, IL

Owner: Orland Fire Protection District
Architect: SRBL Architects, Ltd.

Bid Package #:  Budget Value: -$                     
Description: Pre-Award Date:

Attendees:
Bid Due Date:
Bid Due Time:
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SCOPE DESCRIPTION
Base Bid 134,800$           160,018$             159,341$             125,400$             
Alt #1-Replace Concrete Apron 21,300 21,729 21,719 1,400
Alt #2-PT-1 & PT-2 In Lieu of RT-
1 & RT-2
Alt #3-New CU-2 & CU-3 In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #4-E1: New Generator In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #5-110% P&P Bond 1,500$               1,600$                 2,500$                 4,100$                 

Subtotal: 157,600$           183,347$             183,560$             130,900$             -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         

OFPD/RCCI Appv'd (Y/N)
Prequalification Form (Y/N) Y Y Y N
Ins. Exp. Modifier (#)
Ackn. Schedule (Y/N)
Addenda (#, Y/N) 1-7, Y 1-5, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y
Labor Rates (Y/N) Y Y Y Y
Unit Prices (Y/N) Y Y Y Y
Bid Bond (Y/N) Y Y Y Y
P&P Bond (Y/N)
Delivery (Y/N)
Sales Tax (Y/N)
Union (Y/N)
Pre-Bid Meeting (Y/N)
Site Walk-Thru (Y/N)
Post-Bid Interview (Y/N)
Notes/Comments

Total: 157,600$           183,347$             183,560$             130,900$             -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         

Recommended Award:

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Daniel Smith, Battalion Chief DATE Salvatore (Bob) Cacciato, Trustee, Secretary DATE

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Bryant Krizik, Fire Chief DATE Patrick Maher, Trustee, President DATE

Contract 1.05
Site Concrete

July 7, 2010
2:00 PM

CONTRACTOR
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Project: Administration Addition & Remodel
Location: 9788 West 151st Street, Orland Park, IL

Owner: Orland Fire Protection District
Architect: SRBL Architects, Ltd.

Bid Package #:  Budget Value: -$                     
Description: Pre-Award Date:

Attendees:
Bid Due Date:
Bid Due Time:
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SCOPE DESCRIPTION
Base Bid 40,000$             55,878$               
Alt #1-Replace Concrete Apron
Alt #2-PT-1 & PT-2 In Lieu of RT-
1 & RT-2
Alt #3-New CU-2 & CU-3 In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #4-E1: New Generator In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #5-110% P&P Bond 400$                  No Bid

Subtotal: 40,400$             55,878$               -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         

OFPD/RCCI Appv'd (Y/N)
Prequalification Form (Y/N) Y Submitted
Ins. Exp. Modifier (#)
Ackn. Schedule (Y/N)
Addenda (#, Y/N) 1-7, Y 1-7, Y
Labor Rates (Y/N) Y Y
Unit Prices (Y/N) N N
Bid Bond (Y/N) Y Y
P&P Bond (Y/N)
Delivery (Y/N)
Sales Tax (Y/N)
Union (Y/N)
Pre-Bid Meeting (Y/N)
Site Walk-Thru (Y/N)
Post-Bid Interview (Y/N)
Notes/Comments

Total: 40,400$             55,878$               -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         

Recommended Award:

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Daniel Smith, Battalion Chief DATE Salvatore (Bob) Cacciato, Trustee, Secretary DATE

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Bryant Krizik, Fire Chief DATE Patrick Maher, Trustee, President DATE

Contract 1.06
Fences & Gates

July 7, 2010
2:00 PM

CONTRACTOR
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Project: Administration Addition & Remodel
Location: 9788 West 151st Street, Orland Park, IL

Owner: Orland Fire Protection District
Architect: SRBL Architects, Ltd.

Bid Package #:  Budget Value: -$                     
Description: Pre-Award Date:

Attendees:
Bid Due Date:
Bid Due Time:
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SCOPE DESCRIPTION
Base Bid 74,600$             69,690$               103,055$             83,020$               82,195$               122,144$             
Alt #1-Replace Concrete Apron
Alt #2-PT-1 & PT-2 In Lieu of RT-
1 & RT-2
Alt #3-New CU-2 & CU-3 In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #4-E1: New Generator In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #5-110% P&P Bond 970$                  1,925$                 1,700$                 1,330$                 1,050$                 1,650$                 

Subtotal: 75,570$             71,615$               104,755$             84,350$               83,245$               123,794$             -$                         -$                         

OFPD/RCCI Appv'd (Y/N)
Prequalification Form (Y/N) Y Y Submitted Submitted Responded Submitted
Ins. Exp. Modifier (#)
Ackn. Schedule (Y/N)
Addenda (#, Y/N) 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y
Labor Rates (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y Y
Unit Prices (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y Y
Bid Bond (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y Y
P&P Bond (Y/N)
Delivery (Y/N)
Sales Tax (Y/N)
Union (Y/N)
Pre-Bid Meeting (Y/N)
Site Walk-Thru (Y/N)
Post-Bid Interview (Y/N)
Notes/Comments

Total: 75,570$             71,615$               104,755$             84,350$               83,245$               123,794$             -$                         -$                         

Recommended Award:

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Daniel Smith, Battalion Chief DATE Salvatore (Bob) Cacciato, Trustee, Secretary DATE

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Bryant Krizik, Fire Chief DATE Patrick Maher, Trustee, President DATE

Contract 1.07
Landscaping

July 7, 2010
2:00 PM

CONTRACTOR
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Project: Administration Addition & Remodel
Location: 9788 West 151st Street, Orland Park, IL

Owner: Orland Fire Protection District
Architect: SRBL Architects, Ltd.

Bid Package #:  Budget Value: -$                     
Description: Pre-Award Date:

Attendees:
Bid Due Date:
Bid Due Time:
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SCOPE DESCRIPTION
Base Bid 133,433$           161,700$             156,174$             134,496$             135,509$             127,000$             
Alt #1-Replace Concrete Apron
Alt #2-PT-1 & PT-2 In Lieu of RT-
1 & RT-2
Alt #3-New CU-2 & CU-3 In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #4-E1: New Generator In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #5-110% P&P Bond 3,100$               1,450$                 1,561$                 2,000$                 4,350$                 1,300$                 

Subtotal: 136,533$           163,150$             157,735$             136,496$             139,859$             128,300$             -$                         -$                         

OFPD/RCCI Appv'd (Y/N)
Prequalification Form (Y/N) Y Y Y Y N Y
Ins. Exp. Modifier (#)
Ackn. Schedule (Y/N)
Addenda (#, Y/N) 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-5, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-6, Y
Labor Rates (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y Y
Unit Prices (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y Y
Bid Bond (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y Y
P&P Bond (Y/N)
Delivery (Y/N)
Sales Tax (Y/N)
Union (Y/N)
Pre-Bid Meeting (Y/N)
Site Walk-Thru (Y/N)
Post-Bid Interview (Y/N)
Notes/Comments

Total: 136,533$           163,150$             157,735$             136,496$             139,859$             128,300$             -$                         -$                         

Recommended Award:

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Daniel Smith, Battalion Chief DATE Salvatore (Bob) Cacciato, Trustee, Secretary DATE

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Bryant Krizik, Fire Chief DATE Patrick Maher, Trustee, President DATE

Contract 1.08
Cast-In-Place Concrete

July 7, 2010
2:00 PM

CONTRACTOR
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Project: Administration Addition & Remodel
Location: 9788 West 151st Street, Orland Park, IL

Owner: Orland Fire Protection District
Architect: SRBL Architects, Ltd.

Bid Package #:  Budget Value: -$                     
Description: Pre-Award Date:

Attendees:
Bid Due Date:
Bid Due Time:

SCOPE DESCRIPTION
Base Bid
Alt #1-Replace Concrete Apron
Alt #2-PT-1 & PT-2 In Lieu of RT-
1 & RT-2
Alt #3-New CU-2 & CU-3 In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #4-E1: New Generator In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #5-110% P&P Bond

Subtotal: -$                       -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         

OFPD/RCCI Appv'd (Y/N)
Prequalification Form (Y/N)
Ins. Exp. Modifier (#)
Ackn. Schedule (Y/N)
Addenda (#, Y/N)
Labor Rates (Y/N)
Unit Prices (Y/N)
Bid Bond (Y/N)
P&P Bond (Y/N)
Delivery (Y/N)
Sales Tax (Y/N)
Union (Y/N)
Pre-Bid Meeting (Y/N)
Site Walk-Thru (Y/N)
Post-Bid Interview (Y/N)
Notes/Comments

Total: -$                       -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         

Recommended Award:

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Daniel Smith, Battalion Chief DATE Salvatore (Bob) Cacciato, Trustee, Secretary DATE

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Bryant Krizik, Fire Chief DATE Patrick Maher, Trustee, President DATE

Contract 1.09
Precast Concrete

July 7, 2010
2:00 PM

CONTRACTOR
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Project: Administration Addition & Remodel
Location: 9788 West 151st Street, Orland Park, IL

Owner: Orland Fire Protection District
Architect: SRBL Architects, Ltd.

Bid Package #:  Budget Value: -$                     
Description: Pre-Award Date:

Attendees:
Bid Due Date:
Bid Due Time:
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SCOPE DESCRIPTION
Base Bid 181,894$           198,700$             188,500$             204,900$             169,900$             180,300$             182,000$             304,000$             174,400$                     
Alt #1-Replace Concrete Apron
Alt #2-PT-1 & PT-2 In Lieu of RT-
1 & RT-2
Alt #3-New CU-2 & CU-3 In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #4-E1: New Generator In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #5-110% P&P Bond 1,500$               2,360$                 1,800$                 4,600$                 3,400$                 2,200$                 2,600$                 15,000$               1,460

Subtotal: 183,394$           201,060$             190,300$             209,500$             173,300$             182,500$             184,600$             319,000$             175,860$                     

OFPD/RCCI Appv'd (Y/N)
Prequalification Form (Y/N) Y Y Y Responded Y Submitted N Submitted Submitted
Ins. Exp. Modifier (#)
Ackn. Schedule (Y/N)
Addenda (#, Y/N) 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-5,Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y
Labor Rates (Y/N) Y N Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
Unit Prices (Y/N) Y N Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
Bid Bond (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
P&P Bond (Y/N)
Delivery (Y/N)
Sales Tax (Y/N)
Union (Y/N)
Pre-Bid Meeting (Y/N)
Site Walk-Thru (Y/N)
Post-Bid Interview (Y/N)
Notes/Comments

Total: 183,394$           201,060$             190,300$             209,500$             173,300$             182,500$             184,600$             319,000$             175,860$                     

Recommended Award:

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Daniel Smith, Battalion Chief DATE Salvatore (Bob) Cacciato, Trustee, Secretary DATE

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Bryant Krizik, Fire Chief DATE Patrick Maher, Trustee, President DATE

Contract 1.10
Masonry

July 7, 2010
2:00 PM

CONTRACTOR
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Project: Administration Addition & Remodel
Location: 9788 West 151st Street, Orland Park, IL

Owner: Orland Fire Protection District
Architect: SRBL Architects, Ltd.

Bid Package #:  Budget Value: -$                     
Description: Pre-Award Date:

Attendees:
Bid Due Date:
Bid Due Time:
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SCOPE DESCRIPTION
Base Bid 201,600$           198,400$             219,000$             204,000$             161,400$             
Alt #1-Replace Concrete Apron
Alt #2-PT-1 & PT-2 In Lieu of RT-
1 & RT-2
Alt #3-New CU-2 & CU-3 In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #4-E1: New Generator In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #5-110% P&P Bond 2,218$               8,500$                 1,030$                 2,160$                 1,750$                 

Subtotal: 203,818$           206,900$             220,030$             206,160$             163,150$             -$                         -$                         -$                         

OFPD/RCCI Appv'd (Y/N)
Prequalification Form (Y/N) Y Submitted Y Submitted N
Ins. Exp. Modifier (#)
Ackn. Schedule (Y/N)
Addenda (#, Y/N) 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y
Labor Rates (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y
Unit Prices (Y/N) Y Y Y N Y
Bid Bond (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y
P&P Bond (Y/N)
Delivery (Y/N)
Sales Tax (Y/N)
Union (Y/N)
Pre-Bid Meeting (Y/N)
Site Walk-Thru (Y/N)
Post-Bid Interview (Y/N)
Notes/Comments

Total: 203,818$           206,900$             220,030$             206,160$             163,150$             -$                         -$                         -$                         

Recommended Award:

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Daniel Smith, Battalion Chief DATE Salvatore (Bob) Cacciato, Trustee, Secretary DATE

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Bryant Krizik, Fire Chief DATE Patrick Maher, Trustee, President DATE

Contract 1.11
Structural Steel

July 7, 2010
2:00 PM

CONTRACTOR
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Project: Administration Addition & Remodel
Location: 9788 West 151st Street, Orland Park, IL

Owner: Orland Fire Protection District
Architect: SRBL Architects, Ltd.

Bid Package #:  Budget Value: -$                     
Description: Pre-Award Date:

Attendees:
Bid Due Date:
Bid Due Time:
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SCOPE DESCRIPTION
Base Bid 240,200$           316,086$             295,000$             249,900$             
Alt #1-Replace Concrete Apron
Alt #2-PT-1 & PT-2 In Lieu of RT-
1 & RT-2
Alt #3-New CU-2 & CU-3 In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #4-E1: New Generator In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #5-110% P&P Bond 2,156$               (2,400)$                5,800$                 3,500$                 

Subtotal: 242,356$           313,686$             300,800$             253,400$             -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         

OFPD/RCCI Appv'd (Y/N)
Prequalification Form (Y/N) Y Y Y Y
Ins. Exp. Modifier (#)
Ackn. Schedule (Y/N)
Addenda (#, Y/N) 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y
Labor Rates (Y/N) Y Y Y Y
Unit Prices (Y/N) Y Y Y Y
Bid Bond (Y/N) Y Y Y Y
P&P Bond (Y/N)
Delivery (Y/N)
Sales Tax (Y/N)
Union (Y/N)
Pre-Bid Meeting (Y/N)
Site Walk-Thru (Y/N)
Post-Bid Interview (Y/N)
Notes/Comments

Total: 242,356$           313,686$             300,800$             253,400$             -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         

Recommended Award:

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Daniel Smith, Battalion Chief DATE Salvatore (Bob) Cacciato, Trustee, Secretary DATE

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Bryant Krizik, Fire Chief DATE Patrick Maher, Trustee, President DATE

Contract 1.12
Rough & Finish Carpentry

July 7, 2010
2:00 PM

CONTRACTOR
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Project: Administration Addition & Remodel
Location: 9788 West 151st Street, Orland Park, IL

Owner: Orland Fire Protection District
Architect: SRBL Architects, Ltd.

Bid Package #:  Budget Value: -$                     
Description: Pre-Award Date:

Attendees:
Bid Due Date:
Bid Due Time:
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SCOPE DESCRIPTION
Base Bid 181,380$           167,475$             
Alt #1-Replace Concrete Apron
Alt #2-PT-1 & PT-2 In Lieu of RT-
1 & RT-2
Alt #3-New CU-2 & CU-3 In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #4-E1: New Generator In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #5-110% P&P Bond 3,767$               2,180$                 

Subtotal: 185,147$           169,655$             -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         

OFPD/RCCI Appv'd (Y/N)
Prequalification Form (Y/N) Y Y
Ins. Exp. Modifier (#)
Ackn. Schedule (Y/N)
Addenda (#, Y/N) 1-7, Y 1-7, Y
Labor Rates (Y/N) Y Y
Unit Prices (Y/N) Y N
Bid Bond (Y/N) Y Y
P&P Bond (Y/N)
Delivery (Y/N)
Sales Tax (Y/N)
Union (Y/N)
Pre-Bid Meeting (Y/N)
Site Walk-Thru (Y/N)
Post-Bid Interview (Y/N)
Notes/Comments

Total: 185,147$           169,655$             -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         

Recommended Award:

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Daniel Smith, Battalion Chief DATE Salvatore (Bob) Cacciato, Trustee, Secretary DATE

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Bryant Krizik, Fire Chief DATE Patrick Maher, Trustee, President DATE

Contract 1.13
Roofing & Sheet Metal

July 7, 2010
2:00 PM

CONTRACTOR
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Project: Administration Addition & Remodel
Location: 9788 West 151st Street, Orland Park, IL

Owner: Orland Fire Protection District
Architect: SRBL Architects, Ltd.

Bid Package #:  Budget Value: -$                     
Description: Pre-Award Date:

Attendees:
Bid Due Date:
Bid Due Time:
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SCOPE DESCRIPTION
Base Bid 177,674$           164,530$             197,230$             
Alt #1-Replace Concrete Apron
Alt #2-PT-1 & PT-2 In Lieu of RT-
1 & RT-2
Alt #3-New CU-2 & CU-3 In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #4-E1: New Generator In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #5-110% P&P Bond 4,010$               1,712$                 4,930$                 

Subtotal: 181,684$           166,242$             202,160$             -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         

OFPD/RCCI Appv'd (Y/N)
Prequalification Form (Y/N) Y Submitted Y
Ins. Exp. Modifier (#)
Ackn. Schedule (Y/N)
Addenda (#, Y/N) 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y
Labor Rates (Y/N) Y Y Y
Unit Prices (Y/N) Y Y Y
Bid Bond (Y/N) Y Y Y
P&P Bond (Y/N)
Delivery (Y/N)
Sales Tax (Y/N)
Union (Y/N)
Pre-Bid Meeting (Y/N)
Site Walk-Thru (Y/N)
Post-Bid Interview (Y/N)
Notes/Comments

Total: 181,684$           166,242$             202,160$             -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         

Recommended Award:

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Daniel Smith, Battalion Chief DATE Salvatore (Bob) Cacciato, Trustee, Secretary DATE

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Bryant Krizik, Fire Chief DATE Patrick Maher, Trustee, President DATE

Contract 1.14
Aluminum & Glazing

July 7, 2010
2:00 PM

CONTRACTOR
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Project: Administration Addition & Remodel
Location: 9788 West 151st Street, Orland Park, IL

Owner: Orland Fire Protection District
Architect: SRBL Architects, Ltd.

Bid Package #:  Budget Value: -$                     
Description: Pre-Award Date:

Attendees:
Bid Due Date:
Bid Due Time:
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SCOPE DESCRIPTION
Base Bid 325,000$           334,045$             318,760$             
Alt #1-Replace Concrete Apron
Alt #2-PT-1 & PT-2 In Lieu of RT-
1 & RT-2
Alt #3-New CU-2 & CU-3 In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #4-E1: New Generator In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #5-110% P&P Bond 6,400$               3,490$                 5,420$                 

Subtotal: 331,400$           337,535$             324,180$             -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         

OFPD/RCCI Appv'd (Y/N)
Prequalification Form (Y/N) Y Submitted Y
Ins. Exp. Modifier (#)
Ackn. Schedule (Y/N)
Addenda (#, Y/N) 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y
Labor Rates (Y/N) Y Y Y
Unit Prices (Y/N) Y Y Y
Bid Bond (Y/N) Y Y Y
P&P Bond (Y/N)
Delivery (Y/N)
Sales Tax (Y/N)
Union (Y/N)
Pre-Bid Meeting (Y/N)
Site Walk-Thru (Y/N)
Post-Bid Interview (Y/N)
Notes/Comments

Total: 331,400$           337,535$             324,180$             -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         

Recommended Award:

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Daniel Smith, Battalion Chief DATE Salvatore (Bob) Cacciato, Trustee, Secretary DATE

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Bryant Krizik, Fire Chief DATE Patrick Maher, Trustee, President DATE

Contract 1.15
Gypsum Board Systems

July 7, 2010
2:00 PM

CONTRACTOR
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Project: Administration Addition & Remodel
Location: 9788 West 151st Street, Orland Park, IL

Owner: Orland Fire Protection District
Architect: SRBL Architects, Ltd.

Bid Package #:  Budget Value: -$                     
Description: Pre-Award Date:

Attendees:
Bid Due Date:
Bid Due Time:
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SCOPE DESCRIPTION
Base Bid 34,124$             35,231$               28,708$               34,600$               
Alt #1-Replace Concrete Apron
Alt #2-PT-1 & PT-2 In Lieu of RT-
1 & RT-2 52,647$             56,294$               48,107$               38,806$               
Alt #3-New CU-2 & CU-3 In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #4-E1: New Generator In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #5-110% P&P Bond 1,092$               969$                    414$                    No Bid
Alt #5-110% P&P Bond (Alt #2) 2,803$               1,548$                 No Bid No Bid

Subtotal: 90,666$             94,042$               77,229$               73,406$               -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         

OFPD/RCCI Appv'd (Y/N)
Prequalification Form (Y/N) Y Y N N
Ins. Exp. Modifier (#)
Ackn. Schedule (Y/N)
Addenda (#, Y/N) 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-6, Y 1-7, Y
Labor Rates (Y/N) Y Y Y Y
Unit Prices (Y/N) Y Y Y Y
Bid Bond (Y/N) Y Y Y Y
P&P Bond (Y/N)
Delivery (Y/N)
Sales Tax (Y/N)
Union (Y/N)
Pre-Bid Meeting (Y/N)
Site Walk-Thru (Y/N)
Post-Bid Interview (Y/N)
Notes/Comments

Total: 90,666$             94,042$               77,229$               73,406$               -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         

Recommended Award:

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Daniel Smith, Battalion Chief DATE Salvatore (Bob) Cacciato, Trustee, Secretary DATE

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Bryant Krizik, Fire Chief DATE Patrick Maher, Trustee, President DATE

Contract 1.16
Tile Flooring

July 7, 2010
2:00 PM

CONTRACTOR
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Project: Administration Addition & Remodel
Location: 9788 West 151st Street, Orland Park, IL

Owner: Orland Fire Protection District
Architect: SRBL Architects, Ltd.

Bid Package #:  Budget Value: -$                     
Description: Pre-Award Date:

Attendees:
Bid Due Date:
Bid Due Time:
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SCOPE DESCRIPTION
Base Bid 56,858$             64,600$               61,100$               57,300$               44,310$               
Alt #1-Replace Concrete Apron
Alt #2-PT-1 & PT-2 In Lieu of RT-
1 & RT-2
Alt #3-New CU-2 & CU-3 In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #4-E1: New Generator In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #5-110% P&P Bond 1,100$               1,800$                 765$                    1,155$                 475$                    

Subtotal: 57,958$             66,400$               61,865$               58,455$               44,785$               -$                         -$                         -$                         

OFPD/RCCI Appv'd (Y/N)
Prequalification Form (Y/N) Y Y Submitted Y Y
Ins. Exp. Modifier (#)
Ackn. Schedule (Y/N)
Addenda (#, Y/N) 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y
Labor Rates (Y/N) N Y Y Y Y
Unit Prices (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y
Bid Bond (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y
P&P Bond (Y/N)
Delivery (Y/N)
Sales Tax (Y/N)
Union (Y/N)
Pre-Bid Meeting (Y/N)
Site Walk-Thru (Y/N)
Post-Bid Interview (Y/N)
Notes/Comments

Total: 57,958$             66,400$               61,865$               58,455$               44,785$               -$                         -$                         -$                         

Recommended Award:

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Daniel Smith, Battalion Chief DATE Salvatore (Bob) Cacciato, Trustee, Secretary DATE

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Bryant Krizik, Fire Chief DATE Patrick Maher, Trustee, President DATE

Contract 1.17
Acoustical Ceilings

July 7, 2010
2:00 PM

CONTRACTOR
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Project: Administration Addition & Remodel
Location: 9788 West 151st Street, Orland Park, IL

Owner: Orland Fire Protection District
Architect: SRBL Architects, Ltd.

Bid Package #:  Budget Value: -$                     
Description: Pre-Award Date:

Attendees:
Bid Due Date:
Bid Due Time:
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SCOPE DESCRIPTION
Base Bid 108,782$           80,261$               81,403$               99,700$               
Alt #1-Replace Concrete Apron
Alt #2-PT-1 & PT-2 In Lieu of RT-
1 & RT-2 (26,893)$            (19,209)$              (22,017)$              (40,379)$              
Alt #3-New CU-2 & CU-3 In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #4-E1: New Generator In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #5-110% P&P Bond 2,992$               578$                    1,808$                 No Bid
Alt #5-110% P&P Bond (Alt #2) (739)$                 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Subtotal: 84,142$             61,630$               61,194$               59,321$               -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         

OFPD/RCCI Appv'd (Y/N)
Prequalification Form (Y/N) Y N Submitted N
Ins. Exp. Modifier (#)
Ackn. Schedule (Y/N)
Addenda (#, Y/N) 1-7, Y 1-6, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y
Labor Rates (Y/N) Y Y Y Y
Unit Prices (Y/N) Y Y Y Y
Bid Bond (Y/N) Y Y Y Y
P&P Bond (Y/N)
Delivery (Y/N)
Sales Tax (Y/N)
Union (Y/N)
Pre-Bid Meeting (Y/N)
Site Walk-Thru (Y/N)
Post-Bid Interview (Y/N)
Notes/Comments

Total: 84,142$             61,630$               61,194$               59,321$               -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         

Recommended Award:

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Daniel Smith, Battalion Chief DATE Salvatore (Bob) Cacciato, Trustee, Secretary DATE

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Bryant Krizik, Fire Chief DATE Patrick Maher, Trustee, President DATE

Contract 1.18
Flooring

July 7, 2010
2:00 PM

CONTRACTOR
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Project: Administration Addition & Remodel
Location: 9788 West 151st Street, Orland Park, IL

Owner: Orland Fire Protection District
Architect: SRBL Architects, Ltd.

Bid Package #:  Budget Value: -$                     
Description: Pre-Award Date:

Attendees:
Bid Due Date:
Bid Due Time:
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SCOPE DESCRIPTION
Base Bid 59,800$             44,997$               132,000$             50,000$               31,000$               
Alt #1-Replace Concrete Apron
Alt #2-PT-1 & PT-2 In Lieu of RT-
1 & RT-2
Alt #3-New CU-2 & CU-3 In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #4-E1: New Generator In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #5-110% P&P Bond 1,700$               899$                    1,980$                 1,800$                 1,000$                 

Subtotal: 61,500$             45,896$               133,980$             51,800$               32,000$               -$                         -$                         -$                         

OFPD/RCCI Appv'd (Y/N)
Prequalification Form (Y/N) Y Y Y Submitted N
Ins. Exp. Modifier (#)
Ackn. Schedule (Y/N)
Addenda (#, Y/N) 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-8, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y
Labor Rates (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y
Unit Prices (Y/N) Y Y N Y Y
Bid Bond (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y
P&P Bond (Y/N)
Delivery (Y/N)
Sales Tax (Y/N)
Union (Y/N)
Pre-Bid Meeting (Y/N)
Site Walk-Thru (Y/N)
Post-Bid Interview (Y/N)
Notes/Comments

Total: 61,500$             45,896$               133,980$             51,800$               32,000$               -$                         -$                         -$                         

Recommended Award:

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Daniel Smith, Battalion Chief DATE Salvatore (Bob) Cacciato, Trustee, Secretary DATE

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Bryant Krizik, Fire Chief DATE Patrick Maher, Trustee, President DATE

Contract 1.19
Painting, Coatings, & Wall Covering

July 7, 2010
2:00 PM

CONTRACTOR
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Project: Administration Addition & Remodel
Location: 9788 West 151st Street, Orland Park, IL

Owner: Orland Fire Protection District
Architect: SRBL Architects, Ltd.

Bid Package #:  Budget Value: -$                     
Description: Pre-Award Date:

Attendees:
Bid Due Date:
Bid Due Time:
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SCOPE DESCRIPTION
Base Bid 55,000$             39,000$               49,400$               49,000$               65,400$               40,980$               44,500$               43,519$               26,840$                        26,860$                  
Alt #1-Replace Concrete Apron
Alt #2-PT-1 & PT-2 In Lieu of RT-
1 & RT-2
Alt #3-New CU-2 & CU-3 In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #4-E1: New Generator In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #5-110% P&P Bond 871$                  No Bid 1,000$                 (600)$                   1,400$                 No Bid 950$                    593$                    742$                             900$                       

Subtotal: 55,871$             39,000$               50,400$               48,400$               66,800$               40,980$               45,450$               44,112$               27,582$                        27,760$                  

OFPD/RCCI Appv'd (Y/N)
Prequalification Form (Y/N) N Y Submitted Y Responded Y N Y Submitted N
Ins. Exp. Modifier (#)
Ackn. Schedule (Y/N)
Addenda (#, Y/N) 1-7, Y 1-4, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-6, Y 1-7, Y
Labor Rates (Y/N) Y N Y Y N Y Y N Y N
Unit Prices (Y/N) Y N Y Y Y Y Y Y Y N
Bid Bond (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y N
P&P Bond (Y/N)
Delivery (Y/N)
Sales Tax (Y/N)
Union (Y/N)
Pre-Bid Meeting (Y/N)
Site Walk-Thru (Y/N)
Post-Bid Interview (Y/N)
Notes/Comments

Total: 55,871$             39,000$               50,400$               48,400$               66,800$               40,980$               45,450$               44,112$               27,582$                        27,760$                  

Recommended Award:

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Daniel Smith, Battalion Chief DATE Salvatore (Bob) Cacciato, Trustee, Secretary DATE

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Bryant Krizik, Fire Chief DATE Patrick Maher, Trustee, President DATE

Contract 1.20
Fire Protection Systems

July 7, 2010
2:00 PM

CONTRACTOR
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Project: Administration Addition & Remodel
Location: 9788 West 151st Street, Orland Park, IL

Owner: Orland Fire Protection District
Architect: SRBL Architects, Ltd.

Bid Package #:  Budget Value: -$                     
Description: Pre-Award Date:

Attendees:
Bid Due Date:
Bid Due Time:
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SCOPE DESCRIPTION
Base Bid 147,800$           146,000$             147,500$             169,317$             132,400$             133,890$             
Alt #1-Replace Concrete Apron
Alt #2-PT-1 & PT-2 In Lieu of RT-
1 & RT-2
Alt #3-New CU-2 & CU-3 In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #4-E1: New Generator In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #5-110% P&P Bond 2,000$               1,500$                 2,581$                 1,400$                 968$                    (1,500)$                

Subtotal: 149,800$           147,500$             150,081$             170,717$             133,368$             132,390$             -$                         -$                         

OFPD/RCCI Appv'd (Y/N)
Prequalification Form (Y/N) Y Submitted Submitted Submitted Y Y
Ins. Exp. Modifier (#)
Ackn. Schedule (Y/N)
Addenda (#, Y/N) 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y
Labor Rates (Y/N) Y Y N Y Y N
Unit Prices (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y N
Bid Bond (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y Y
P&P Bond (Y/N)
Delivery (Y/N)
Sales Tax (Y/N)
Union (Y/N)
Pre-Bid Meeting (Y/N)
Site Walk-Thru (Y/N)
Post-Bid Interview (Y/N)
Notes/Comments

Total: 149,800$           147,500$             150,081$             170,717$             133,368$             132,390$             -$                         -$                         

Recommended Award:

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Daniel Smith, Battalion Chief DATE Salvatore (Bob) Cacciato, Trustee, Secretary DATE

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Bryant Krizik, Fire Chief DATE Patrick Maher, Trustee, President DATE

Contract 1.21
Plumbing Systems

July 7, 2010
2:00 PM

CONTRACTOR
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Project: Administration Addition & Remodel
Location: 9788 West 151st Street, Orland Park, IL

Owner: Orland Fire Protection District
Architect: SRBL Architects, Ltd.

Bid Package #:  Budget Value: -$                     
Description: Pre-Award Date:

Attendees:
Bid Due Date:
Bid Due Time:
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SCOPE DESCRIPTION
Base Bid 542,323$           595,000$             598,000$             554,900$             772,680$             674,000$             584,000$             598,400$             
Alt #1-Replace Concrete Apron
Alt #2-PT-1 & PT-2 In Lieu of RT-
1 & RT-2
Alt #3-New CU-2 & CU-3 In Lieu 
of Existing 4,500$               6,200$                 10,500$               5,490$                 41,000$               12,000$               15,000$               10,575$               
Alt #4-E1: New Generator In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #5-110% P&P Bond 6,000$               10,500$               6,000$                 9,730$                 No Bid 9,600$                 7,200$                 4,200$                 

Subtotal: 552,823$           611,700$             614,500$             570,120$             813,680$             695,600$             606,200$             613,175$             

OFPD/RCCI Appv'd (Y/N)
Prequalification Form (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Responded N Submitted Submitted
Ins. Exp. Modifier (#)
Ackn. Schedule (Y/N)
Addenda (#, Y/N) 1-7, Y 1-5, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y 1-7, Y
Labor Rates (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y Y N Y
Unit Prices (Y/N) Y Y Y N Y Y N N
Bid Bond (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
P&P Bond (Y/N)
Delivery (Y/N)
Sales Tax (Y/N)
Union (Y/N)
Pre-Bid Meeting (Y/N)
Site Walk-Thru (Y/N)
Post-Bid Interview (Y/N)
Notes/Comments

Total: 552,823$           611,700$             614,500$             570,120$             813,680$             695,600$             606,200$             613,175$             

Recommended Award:

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Daniel Smith, Battalion Chief DATE Salvatore (Bob) Cacciato, Trustee, Secretary DATE

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Bryant Krizik, Fire Chief DATE Patrick Maher, Trustee, President DATE

Contract 1.22
Mechanical Systems

July 7, 2010
2:00 PM

CONTRACTOR

Page 21 of 23



Project: Administration Addition & Remodel
Location: 9788 West 151st Street, Orland Park, IL

Owner: Orland Fire Protection District
Architect: SRBL Architects, Ltd.

Bid Package #:  Budget Value: -$                     
Description: Pre-Award Date:

Attendees:
Bid Due Date:
Bid Due Time:
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SCOPE DESCRIPTION
Base Bid 29,950$             15,400$               8,200$                 
Alt #1-Replace Concrete Apron
Alt #2-PT-1 & PT-2 In Lieu of RT-
1 & RT-2
Alt #3-New CU-2 & CU-3 In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #4-E1: New Generator In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #5-110% P&P Bond 300.00$             No Bid 250.00$               

Subtotal: 30,250$             15,400$               8,450$                 -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         

OFPD/RCCI Appv'd (Y/N)
Prequalification Form (Y/N) N Submitted Y
Ins. Exp. Modifier (#)
Ackn. Schedule (Y/N)
Addenda (#, Y/N) 1-7, Y 1-6, Y 1-7, Y
Labor Rates (Y/N) Y Y Y
Unit Prices (Y/N) N N N
Bid Bond (Y/N) Y Y Y
P&P Bond (Y/N)
Delivery (Y/N)
Sales Tax (Y/N)
Union (Y/N)
Pre-Bid Meeting (Y/N)
Site Walk-Thru (Y/N)
Post-Bid Interview (Y/N)
Notes/Comments

Total: 30,250$             15,400$               8,450$                 -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         -$                         

Recommended Award:

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Daniel Smith, Battalion Chief DATE Salvatore (Bob) Cacciato, Trustee, Secretary DATE

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Bryant Krizik, Fire Chief DATE Patrick Maher, Trustee, President DATE

Contract 1.23
Testing, Adjusting, & Balancing

July 7, 2010
2:00 PM

CONTRACTOR
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Project: Administration Addition & Remodel
Location: 9788 West 151st Street, Orland Park, IL

Owner: Orland Fire Protection District
Architect: SRBL Architects, Ltd.

Bid Package #:  Budget Value: -$                     
Description: Pre-Award Date:

Attendees:
Bid Due Date:
Bid Due Time:
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SCOPE DESCRIPTION
Base Bid 569,900$           498,000$             579,400$             552,487$             470,309$             624,995$             
Alt #1-Replace Concrete Apron No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 29,268$               
Alt #2-PT-1 & PT-2 In Lieu of RT-
1 & RT-2
Alt #3-New CU-2 & CU-3 In Lieu 
of Existing 2,250$               No Bid 32,300$               5,190$                 3,623$                 No Bid
Alt #4-E1: New Generator In Lieu 
of Existing
Alt #5-110% P&P Bond 7,125$               5,500$                 No Bid 16,500$               4,998$                 No Bid

Subtotal: 579,275$           503,500$             611,700$             574,177$             478,930$             654,263$             -$                         -$                         

OFPD/RCCI Appv'd (Y/N)
Prequalification Form (Y/N) Y Y Y Responded Y Y
Ins. Exp. Modifier (#)
Ackn. Schedule (Y/N)
Addenda (#, Y/N) 1-7 Y 1-7 Y 1-7 Y 1-7 Y 1-7 Y 1-7 Y
Labor Rates (Y/N) Y Y Y? Y Y Y
Unit Prices (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y Y
Bid Bond (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y Y
P&P Bond (Y/N)
Delivery (Y/N)
Sales Tax (Y/N)
Union (Y/N)
Pre-Bid Meeting (Y/N)
Site Walk-Thru (Y/N)
Post-Bid Interview (Y/N)
Notes/Comments

Total: 579,275$           503,500$             611,700$             574,177$             478,930$             654,263$             -$                         -$                         

Recommended Award:

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Daniel Smith, Battalion Chief DATE Salvatore (Bob) Cacciato, Trustee, Secretary DATE

OFPD Approval: OFPD Approval:
Bryant Krizik, Fire Chief DATE Patrick Maher, Trustee, President DATE

Contract 1.24
Electrical & Low Voltage

July 7, 2010
2:00 PM

CONTRACTOR
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